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Watercolor "light" is, in essence, the white of the paper contrasting with the shapes and colors of your
washes. In this book, you'll learn how to make the most of this powerful relationship. By working through a
series of step-by-step demonstrations - each building on the one before it - you'll gain a practical
understanding of how to design your paintings - and plan the light - right from the start; "carve" out your
white areas with rich shadows and shapes; juxtapose bright colors against colorful grays; use broken color to
"punch up" the point of interest; and achieve a powerful simplicity by seeing your subject as dynamic shapes
of color. From thumbnail sketches to finishing touches, watch as Marilyn paints a broad range of
subjects...sun-drenched florals, light-filled interiors, dramatic still lifes, cityscapes and harbors. Throughout,
she shares her special ways of working - including the way she uses a palette knife to create texture and how
she achieves the interesting "Simandle Grays" that fill her shadows.
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From reader reviews:

Gregory Phipps:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible Capturing Light in
Watercolor? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with
the favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have other opinion?

Evelyn Montgomery:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your free time/ holiday? May be reading a book could be option to fill your no cost time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to test look
for book, may be the publication untitled Capturing Light in Watercolor can be fine book to read. May be it
can be best activity to you.

Brian Hill:

The book untitled Capturing Light in Watercolor contain a lot of information on the item. The writer
explains your ex idea with easy method. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do
certainly not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was compiled by famous author. The author will
bring you in the new period of time of literary works. You can read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy
the e-book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice read.

Terrance Pitt:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is created or printed or created from each source that will filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Capturing Light in Watercolor when you needed it?
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