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On the evening of November 26, 1703, a hurricane from the north Atlantic hammered into Britain: it remains
the worst storm the nation has ever experienced. Eyewitnesses saw cows thrown into trees and windmills
ablaze from the friction of their whirling sails—and some 8,000 people lost their lives. For Defoe, bankrupt
and just released from prison for his "seditious" writings, the storm struck during one of his bleakest
moments. But it also furnished him with material for his first book, and in this powerful depiction of
suffering and survival played out against a backdrop of natural devastation we can trace the outlines of
Defoe’s later masterpieces, A Journal of the Plague Year and Robinson Crusoe.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Martinez:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what
kind of book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really
feel happy read one with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Typically the The Storm (Penguin
Classics) is kind of publication which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Jane Nelsen:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
when those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take The Storm (Penguin Classics) as the daily resource
information.

Cathy Duran:

This book untitled The Storm (Penguin Classics) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this specific
book in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is
no reason to you to past this book from your list.

Kimberly Foust:

This The Storm (Penguin Classics) is great e-book for you because the content and that is full of information
for you who else always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal
it details accurately using great organize word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So if you are
read it hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight
forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having The Storm (Penguin
Classics) in your hand like having the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no
book that offer you world within ten or fifteen minute right but this book already do that. So , it is good
reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt that will?
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