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Welcome to The Sand Bar, the notorious tavern where most gay folks in Bayetteville and the surrounding
area get together. Come in through the back door off the alley. The bar is at the end of that long hallway. Pull
up a stool and let hunky Cody the bartender get you a beer or mix up one of his famous margaritas. Make
yourself comfortable and have a look around. You never know who you re going to meet here. Those punks
over by the jukebox are Del and his buddy Slags. Chances are they're up to no good. The kid standing near
them is Fred who's had a crush on Del since even before Del started hustling. That redheaded guy at the table
by the dance floor is Kevin. He's got a girlfriend waiting for him at home, but lately he and Cody have been
making eyes at one another. At the end of the bar Jack-O is swaying on his stool and going on to Heather
who's killing time waiting for her latest lady friend to get off work at the mall. Sitting alongside them
looking like a cardinal sin in that skin tight black dress is Bruschetta. She's nice enough, but don t cross her.
The pock-marked guy down at the other end of the bar sucking on a longneck is Leo. He owns this place and
lives upstairs. He opened The Sand Bar after being convinced the town needed a gay bar by his best friend
Sister who's the one in the flannel shirt with one boot on the bar rail waiting his turn at pool. Make yourself
comfortable and stay a while. What's being offered is a glimpse inside the intertwined loves, dreams,
downfalls and dramas of the these folks as well as several others. Along the way there'll be plenty of sex,
some laughs and even some tears. Though it may not be pretty or always nice, The Sand Bar isn't a place
you're likely to soon forget and the people who've come to call it home are even more memorable.
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From reader reviews:

Lourdes Tyner:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important normally. The book The Sand Bar ended up being making you to know about
other understanding and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you.
The reserve The Sand Bar is not only giving you more new information but also to become your friend when
you experience bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship
using the book The Sand Bar. You never truly feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Katrina Scofield:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How people have
to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Studying a book can help people out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Sand Bar book as
this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Wade Diaz:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a new
book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all day every day to
reading a guide. The book The Sand Bar it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people who
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough
space bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book through
your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book offers high quality.

Richard Thompson:

E-book is one of source of information. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen have to have book to know the update information of year for you to year. As we know
those textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the
world. With the book The Sand Bar we can consider more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To
get creative person must prefer to read a book. Simply choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't
be doubt to change your life at this book The Sand Bar. You can more desirable than now.
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