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Charlie Birger's legacy is that of the most popular and, arguably, the most violent gangster in southern
Illinois during the 1920s. A Russian immigrant who first proved his grit on the streets of St. Louis as a
newsboy, Birger later excelled in boxing and breaking horses in the West. But the coming of Prohibition to
the coal fields of southern Illinois provided the opportunity for Birger to become a key figure in a maelstrom
of violence that would shock the country. Bolstered by years of research and interviews, Gary DeNeal
tenders an insightful biography of this controversial character. Enhanced by newly discovered photographs
and a new chapter, the second edition of A Knight of Another Sort brings Birger and his bloody era vividly
to life. Drawing from the colorful cast of the living, the dead, and the soon-to-be-dead - a state shared by
many associated with Charlie and his enemies, the Shelton gang - DeNeal re-creates Prohibition-era southern
Illinois. He depicts the fatal shootout between S. Glenn Young and Ora Thomas, the battle on the Herrin
Masonic Temple lawn in which six were slain and the Ku Klux Klan crushed, and the wounding of
Williamson County state's attorney Arlie O. Boswell. The gang wars ended with massive arrests, trials, and
convictions of gangsters who once had seemed invincible. Charlie Birger was convicted of the murder of
West City mayor Joe Adams and sentenced to death. On April 19, 1928, Birger stood on the gallows looking
down on the large crowd that had come to see him die. "It's a beautiful world, " Birger said softly as he
prepared to leave it.
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From reader reviews:

Rodney Schmitt:

Here thing why that A Knight of Another Sort: Prohibition Days and Charlie Birger, Second Edition
(Shawnee Classics) are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all reading a book is good nevertheless
it depends in the content from it which is the content is as tasty as food or not. A Knight of Another Sort:
Prohibition Days and Charlie Birger, Second Edition (Shawnee Classics) giving you information deeper as
different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no guide that similar with A Knight of Another
Sort: Prohibition Days and Charlie Birger, Second Edition (Shawnee Classics). It gives you thrill reading
journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is maybe
can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your way
home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of A Knight
of Another Sort: Prohibition Days and Charlie Birger, Second Edition (Shawnee Classics) in e-book can be
your option.

Paula Daniels:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like
reading book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a guide will give
you a lot of new details. When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of
many ways to share the information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more
imaginative. When you looking at a book especially fiction book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the people do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you
read this A Knight of Another Sort: Prohibition Days and Charlie Birger, Second Edition (Shawnee
Classics), you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can
inspire the mediocre, make them reading a publication.

William McDowell:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like A Knight of Another Sort:
Prohibition Days and Charlie Birger, Second Edition (Shawnee Classics) which is getting the e-book version.
So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Helen Massey:

As we know that book is important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This reserve A Knight of Another Sort: Prohibition Days and Charlie Birger, Second



Edition (Shawnee Classics) was filled about science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about
your science competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big
benefit of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to
get book that you simply wanted.
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