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In Crime is Not the Problem, Franklin Zimring and Gordon Hawkins revolutionize the way we think about
crime and violence--by forcing us to distinguish between crime and violence. The authors reveal that
compared to other industrialized nations, in most categories of nonviolent crime, American crime rates are
comparable--even lower, in some cases. Only when it comes to lethal violence does the United States
outpace other Western nations, with homicide rates many, many times greater. London and New York City
have nearly the same number of robberies and burglaries each year, but robbers and burglars kill 54 victims
in New York for every victim death in London.
Why are the risks so much greater that victims will be killed or maimed in the United States? And what can
be done to bring the death rate from American violence down to tolerable levels? The authors show how the
impact of television and movie violence on rates of homicide is wildly overrated, but emphasize the
paramount importance of guns.
By making the crucial distinction between lethal violence and crime in general, the authors clear the ground
for a targeted, far more effective response to the real crisis in American society. Crime is Not the Problem
will reshape the debate about crime control in the United States.
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From reader reviews:

James Bauer:

Here thing why this specific Crime Is Not the Problem: Lethal Violence in America (Studies in Crime and
Public Policy) are different and trusted to be yours. First of all reading a book is good but it depends in the
content of it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Crime Is Not the Problem: Lethal Violence in
America (Studies in Crime and Public Policy) giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find
any publication out there but there is no reserve that similar with Crime Is Not the Problem: Lethal Violence
in America (Studies in Crime and Public Policy). It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own
personal eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you.
You can actually bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your means home by train. For
anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Crime Is Not the Problem:
Lethal Violence in America (Studies in Crime and Public Policy) in e-book can be your substitute.

Kathleen King:

This Crime Is Not the Problem: Lethal Violence in America (Studies in Crime and Public Policy) is great
reserve for you because the content and that is full of information for you who all always deal with world
and still have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it details accurately using great
manage word or we can declare no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have
whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Crime Is Not the Problem: Lethal Violence in America
(Studies in Crime and Public Policy) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen tiny right but this
publication already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you
still doubt that will?

Dora Gourley:

Reading a book to get new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you read a book you
can get a wide range of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, mainly because
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that you
have read. If you would like get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and also soon.
The Crime Is Not the Problem: Lethal Violence in America (Studies in Crime and Public Policy) provide you
with a new experience in reading a book.

Kristen Mazur:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or real their



hobby. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but nothing
reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Crime Is Not the Problem: Lethal Violence in America (Studies in
Crime and Public Policy) can make you sense more interested to read.
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