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"This book is beautiful.” — A.O. Scott, New York Times Book Review, cover review

Following on the heels of his New York Times bestselling novel Telegraph Avenue, Pulitzer Prize-winning
author Michael Chabon delivers another literary masterpiece: a novel of truth and lies, family legends, and
existential adventure—and the forces that work to destroy us.

In 1989, fresh from the publication of his first novel, The Mysteries of Pittsburgh, Michael Chabon traveled
to his mother’s home in Oakland, California, to visit his terminally ill grandfather. Tongue loosened by
powerful painkillers, memory stirred by the imminence of death, Chabon’s grandfather shared recollections
and told stories the younger man had never heard before, uncovering bits and pieces of a history long buried
and forgotten. That dreamlike week of revelations forms the basis for the novel Moonglow, the latest feat of
legerdemain from Pulitzer Prize-winning author Michael Chabon.

 Moonglow unfolds as the deathbed confession of a man the narrator refers to only as “my grandfather.” It is
a tale of madness, of war and adventure, of sex and marriage and desire, of existential doubt and model
rocketry, of the shining aspirations and demonic underpinnings of American technological accomplishment
at midcentury, and, above all, of the destructive impact—and the creative power—of keeping secrets and
telling lies. It is a portrait of the difficult but passionate love between the narrator’s grandfather and his
grandmother, an enigmatic woman broken by her experience growing up in war-torn France. It is also a tour
de force of speculative autobiography in which Chabon devises and reveals a secret history of his own
imagination.

 From the Jewish slums of prewar South Philadelphia to the invasion of Germany, from a Florida retirement
village to the penal utopia of New York’s Wallkill prison, from the heyday of the space program to the
twilight of the “American Century,” the novel revisits an entire era through a single life and collapses a
lifetime into a single week. A lie that tells the truth, a work of fictional nonfiction, an autobiography wrapped
in a novel disguised as a memoir, Moonglow is Chabon at his most moving and inventive.
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From reader reviews:

Margert Lewis:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or even goal; it means that reserve
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who
don't like reading through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult
problem or exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Moonglow: A Novel.

Michael Short:

In other case, little individuals like to read book Moonglow: A Novel. You can choose the best book if you
love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any book Moonglow: A Novel. You can
add information and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, simply because from
book you can learn everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple
matter until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we could open a book or perhaps searching by
internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's go through.

Richard Osteen:

This Moonglow: A Novel is great publication for you because the content which can be full of information
for you who all always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. This particular book
reveal it data accurately using great coordinate word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So if you
are read the item hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward
sentences but challenging core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Moonglow: A Novel in
your hand like having the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no e-book that
offer you world with ten or fifteen small right but this book already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hi
Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that will?

Virginia Hause:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book Moonglow: A Novel was vibrant and of course has pictures
on the website. As we know that book Moonglow: A Novel has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until
young adults. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and think you are the character on there.
Therefore , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to
choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading that.
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