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ACSM’s Guide to Exercise and Cancer Survivorship presents the science behind the benefits of exercise for
cancer survival and survivorship as well as the application of that science to the design or adaptation of
exercise programs for cancer patients and survivors. Developed by the American College of Sports Medicine
(ACSM), this authoritative reference offers the most current information for health and fitness professionals
working with survivors of many types of cancers.

Dr. Melinda L. Irwin has assembled a team of the most respected experts in the field of exercise and cancer
survivorship. With an emphasis on practical application, the text discusses the following:

• Incidence and prevalence of the most common cancers

• Common cancer treatments and side effects

• Benefits of exercise after a diagnosis of cancer

• Exercise testing, prescription, and programming

• Nutrition and weight management

• Counseling for health behavior change

• Injury prevention

• Program administration

This guide presents evidence-based information to assist health, fitness, and medical professionals in using
exercise to help cancer survivors with recovery, rehabilitation, and reducing the risk of recurrence.
Throughout the text, readers will find quick-reference Take-Home Messages that highlight key information
and how it can be applied in practice. Chapters also include reproducible forms and questionnaires to
facilitate the implementation of an exercise program with a new client or patient, such as physician’s
permission forms, medical and cancer treatment history forms, weekly logs of exercise and energy levels,
medication listings, and nutrition and goal-setting questionnaires.

In addition, ACSM’s Guide to Exercise and Cancer Survivorship discusses all of the job task analysis points
tested in the ACSM/ACS Certified Cancer Exercise Trainer (CET) exam, making this the most complete
resource available for health and fitness professionals studying to attain CET certification. Each chapter
begins with a list of the CET exam points discussed in that chapter. A complete listing is also included in the
appendix. As both an essential preparation text for certification and a practical reference, ACSM’s Guide to
Exercise and Cancer Survivorship will increase health and fitness professionals’ knowledge of the benefits
of exercise after a cancer diagnosis as well as the specifics of developing and adapting exercise programs to
meet the unique needs of cancer survivors.

Evidence has shown that physical activity has numerous health benefits for cancer patients and survivors.
More clinicians and oncologists are recommending exercise as a strategy for reducing the side effects of
treatment, speeding recovery, and improving overall quality of life. In turn, cancer survivors are seeking
health and fitness professionals with knowledge and experience to help them learn how to exercise safely
within their capabilities. With ACSM’s Guide to Exercise and Cancer Survivorship, health and fitness
professionals can provide safe exercise programs to help cancer survivors improve their health, take
proactive steps toward preventing recurrences, and enhance their quality of life.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Berg:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book ACSM's Guide to Exercise and Cancer
Survivorship. All type of book is it possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet resources
or other social media.

Kathryn Mullins:

This ACSM's Guide to Exercise and Cancer Survivorship book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it
then the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is actually information inside this
publication incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you
will get. This specific ACSM's Guide to Exercise and Cancer Survivorship without we recognize teach the
one who reading through it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry ACSM's Guide
to Exercise and Cancer Survivorship can bring any time you are and not make your handbag space or
bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This ACSM's
Guide to Exercise and Cancer Survivorship having very good arrangement in word and layout, so you will
not experience uninterested in reading.

Hilda Dolan:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book thus.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new details. When
you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the figures do
it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to some others. When you read this ACSM's Guide to
Exercise and Cancer Survivorship, you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours guide.
Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a reserve.

John Bergeron:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about
the data about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to their book. One of



them is this ACSM's Guide to Exercise and Cancer Survivorship.
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