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Aboard the starship Undertoe, a skeleton crew of misfits takes orders from a smugly bureaucratic computer
which couldn't care less if they live or die. The Undertoe is part of the Galactic Freedom Corporation, a
huge interstellar conglomerate whose owner -- the inconceivably wealthy Largo Foote -- has a cunning
scheme to seize control of the galactic economy.

Unaware that their ship is a key pawn in Largo's master plan, the crew just try to do their jobs, despite the
fact that their assignments rarely make sense, and deadly peril seems to stalk them at every turn. As things go
from bad to worse, the ship and crew are inexorably drawn to the astonishing Footesphere, Largo Foote's
vast and top-secret private residence, where something sinister is afoot...

------------------------

Set in a future that is both weird and weirdly familiar, Robot Captain is a comic sci-fi adventure filled with
reluctant heroes, strange aliens, lunatic machines, and more than a few twisted surprises.

------------------------

About the Author:

Doug Bedwell has written over fifty plays, which have been presented at professional, academic, and
community theatres nationwide. In 2015, Space Bear Press published a two-volume set of his collected
works. Robot Captain is his first novel.
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From reader reviews:

Kathy Woodward:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what you problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have
spare time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? Every individual has many questions above. They need to answer that question because just their
can do in which. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start
from on kindergarten until university need that Robot Captain to read.

Alma Miranda:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a
new book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent 24 hours a
day to reading a reserve. The book Robot Captain it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people who
recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space
to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book out of your
smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book has high quality.

Gary Clark:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Robot Captain, you could enjoy
both. It is excellent combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its
mind hangout people. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Antonette Schneider:

The book untitled Robot Captain contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains your girlfriend idea
with easy method. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to
read this. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new period of time of
literary works. You can read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or product, so you can
read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official
web-site and order it. Have a nice examine.
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