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AMAZON.COM'S BEST GRAPHIC NOVEL OF 2013!

"Marble Season sometimes feels like one long, seamless shot of budding love, brimming violence and
suddenly struck friendships. This is a highly physical, meta-Peanuts suburban universe in which adults are
off-camera, but navigating other kids is plenty harrowing." -Washington Post Best Comics of 2013

The untold coming-of-age story from a contemporary comics master

Marble Season is the semiautobiographical novel by the acclaimed cartoonist Gilbert Hernandez, author of
the epic masterpiece Palomar and cocreator, with his brothers, Jaime and Mario, of the groundbreaking Love
and Rockets comic book series. Marble Season is his first book with Drawn & Quarterly, and one of the
most anticipated books of 2013. It tells the untold stories from the early years of these American comics
legends, but also portrays the reality of life in a large family in suburban 1960s California. Pop-culture
references-TV shows, comic books, and music-saturate this evocative story of a young family navigating
cultural and neighborhood norms set against the golden age of the American dream and the silver age of
comics.
Middle child Huey stages Captain America plays and treasures his older brother's comic book collection
almost as much as his approval. Marble Season subtly and deftly details how the innocent, joyfully creative
play that children engage in (shooting marbles, backyard performances, and organizing treasure hunts)
changes as they grow older and encounter name-calling naysayers, abusive bullies, and the value judgments
of other kids. An all-ages story, Marble Season masterfully explores the redemptive and timeless power of
storytelling and role play in childhood, making it a coming-of-age story that is as resonant with the children
of today as with the children of the sixties.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Jorge:

Exactly why? Because this Marble Season is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for
you to snap that but latter it will surprise you with the secret that inside. Reading this book close to it was
fantastic author who all write the book in such remarkable way makes the content interior easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this ever again or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of advantages than the other
book include such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking method. So , still want to hold up
having that book? If I have been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Mark Gallegos:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you read a book you
can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply because
book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you act like
you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon. The Marble Season will
give you a new experience in looking at a book.

Darlene Beaudoin:

You can obtain this Marble Season by visit the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it might to be
your solve challenge if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not
only simply by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era
including now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now,
choose your own personal ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange
you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.

David Wilkens:

A number of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a publication. They are directly felt
the item when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Marble Season to make your own
personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading proficiency is developing when you such as
reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the feeling about book and looking
at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and go through it. Beside that the
book Marble Season can to be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must
you're doing of this time.
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