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Does enlightenment sound blissful but seem like too lofty a goal for you? Take heart! In just a few simple
steps, you can be en route to experiencing the joy of personal transformation.

The True You is nothing less than eternal and divine love, but shedding the world’s judgments and illusions
requires patient dedication. Over the course of a year, The 52: Discover the True You in 52 Simple Lessons
can lead you slowly but surely to living as your truest self.

Author Deanne Mincer, a yoga and spiritual teacher with twenty-five years’ experience, has crafted an
accessible guide that’s easy to follow and refreshingly lighthearted. Inspired by both ancient and
contemporary wisdom from diverse spiritual backgrounds—including the likes of Jesus, Rumi, the Buddha,
Lao Tsu, Eckhart Tolle, and Mark Twain—this practical book is organized into fifty-two lessons that will
help you grow in self-awareness as you implement that week’s ideas for becoming happier and more loving
into your everyday existence.

Are you ready to start the most important journey of your life? Take a deep breath. Let it out slowly. Repeat.
Now, open your copy of The 52, and let’s begin.
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From reader reviews:

Harry Greene:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a publication your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is high.
For yourself who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular The 52: Discovering
the True You in 52 Simple Lessons book as beginning and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is
usually more than just a book.

Adrian Kao:

This book untitled The 52: Discovering the True You in 52 Simple Lessons to be one of several books that
best seller in this year, here is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You
will easily to buy that book in the book retail outlet or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile
phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this book from your list.

Charles Steen:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like
reading book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a publication will give you a
lot of new data. When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of many ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the figures
do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read this The 52:
Discovering the True You in 52 Simple Lessons, you are able to tells your family, friends and also soon
about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Shawn Clay:

The publication with title The 52: Discovering the True You in 52 Simple Lessons posesses a lot of
information that you can study it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This kind of book exist
new knowledge the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world at this
point. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This particular book will
bring you in new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this
anywhere you want.
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