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Evil lurks in the dark, striking at mankind in a never-ending war of attempted genocide. For centuries, heroes
have stood against the forces of darkness, protecting humanity one victory at a time. But with the dawning of
the 20th Century, mankind is finally ready to go to war... During intense fighting in 1950 Korea, a young
Army Intelligence translator finds himself accompanying an unusual detachment of soldiers deep behind
enemy lines to capture a downed Soviet MiG pilot. But the Shadow Detachment, like their quarry, is more
than what they seem--a rag tag band of supersoldiers with strange abilities and experience in hunting dark
creatures threatening not just America, but all of humanity. Follow Mark Kenslir as he joins the fight against
the mythical and the magical on multiple continents, becoming a skilled supersoldier adept at defeating evil
over several decades. From a Soviet skinwalker in Korea, to Vampires in Morocco, demons under Australia,
and a hi-tech Coven in Hong Kong, Kenslir and his compatriots will face the most dangerous evil on earth--
and from beyond. Werewolves, Faeries, Voodoo Warlords, False Gods, and Parahuman Terrorists are just
some of the threats the Shadow Detachment must defeat throughout the Cold War, or mankind is doomed.
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From reader reviews:

Sally Watts:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get lot of stress
from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely of course.
People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity have you got when the spare
time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading ebooks.
It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is actually
A Cold Dark War.

Peter Barba:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make anyone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is A Cold Dark War this book consist a lot of the information with the condition of
this world now. This specific book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The words styles
that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some investigation when he makes this
book. Here is why this book ideal all of you.

Teresa Burns:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This A Cold Dark War can be the response, oh
how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in
this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Elaine West:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have
to do is just spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the books in
the top record in your reading list is A Cold Dark War. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry
Hills can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking right up and review this guide you can
get many advantages.
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